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Often, the
immediate issues
and spectacle of
politics occupy the
attention of students

of both domestic and international
affairs. Rarely do they reflect on the
everyday practices they voluntarily
engage in—practices that enable the
state to exert control over their bodies.
These practices, being normalised
and deeply woven into the

functioning of the modern state, are
seldom questioned. We often
overlook the need to investigate their
premises or trace the history that has
led us to the present political
arrangement.

Charlotte Epstein’s Birth of the
State adopts a poststructuralist
approach to explore the historical
construction of three pivotal modern
concepts—security, liberty, and
property—upon which politics
ostensibly rests. By examining how
these concepts were contingently
constructed within the evolving
relationship between the state and
the subject, Epstein invites readers
to reflect on their status and function
in relation to the corporeal body
today. Are these principles now the
essence of the modern state, or have
they become the very sites of its
violations, she asks. At the outset,
Epstein lays out the purpose of her
inquiry as “about the co-constitution
of the state and the modern political
subject” (p. 2), contending that
neither the state nor the political
subject exists independently of the
other. What links them then, she
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argues, is their mutual constitution
as mediated through the triad of
political concepts—security, liberty,
and property.

Epstein argues that this
configuration began to take shape
during two major crises in Europe:
the religious wars and the scientific
revolution. The latter played a
particularly crucial role in ushering
in modernity. “Modernity began the
moment the knowledge turned
upon itself, in order to consider not
only what could be known in the
world, but how such a knowledge
was possible in the first place”
(p.44). This turning point in
epistemology opened space for
alternative understandings of the
world and, more importantly, of
human beings and their role within
it. Amid the chaos of religious
conflict, Thomas Hobbes found an
opportunity to articulate a vision that
denaturalised humans and instead
sought to construct a contract
between corporeal bodies that
would eliminate the violence
perpetuated by religious dogma.
His aim, as Epstein notes, was to
replace “a naturalist final cause with
a human-made one: peace” (p.46).

Modern politics, then, becomes
the craft of individuals who
construct a political mechanism to
bind even religious rulers by

persuading them that it is the most
efficient means of securing a stable
political community. Hobbes
achieved this by denaturalising
human beings and emphasising their
corporeality, arguing that “what is
incorporeal is nothing” (p.57). By
dismissing the non-material
dimensions of human life, he reduced
political motivation to a “pure
natural-cum-political” impulse: self-
preservation (p.60). Once humans
were separated from nature and their
souls neutralised, Hobbes concluded
that “the desire to be safe is [a] natural
desire that drives humans out of the
state of nature to build the state”
(ibid.). In this framework, the state
thus becomes not just a choice but a
necessary condition for security.

The creation of the state, however,
did not exclude the people who would
comprise it. Rather, it came into being
through a contract voluntarily agreed
upon by newly defined political
subjects with an agency to consent
(p.86). In this process, traditional
communal and topological
understandings of liberty were
transformed into a singular notion of
liberty linked directly to the corporeal
body (p.109, 112). Calvin’s case
further entrenched this
transformation and became
foundational in this shift by marking
the beginning of ‘laws of
naturalisation’ and ‘citizenship
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rights’ tied to territorial belonging
(p.114). In this context, Epstein notes
that “the Sovereign-Subject relation
was corpo-realised in the law in
Calvin’s Case, realised by being
rooted in the body” (p.118).

While Hobbes externalised liberty
by rooting it in the physical body,
John Locke reintroduced liberty
through the interior domain of
conscience. Yet, Locke’s concept of
conscience was not entirely internal
or natural; it was, as Epstein puts it,
“a disciplined conscience” (p.132).
Locke maintained that humans, as
“sensible beings,” possessed
faculties that enabled them to acquire
knowledge (p.152). Thus, the idea of
consent diverged in meaning
between Hobbes and Locke: for
Hobbes, it was “the movement of an
embodied will” aimed at securing
safety; for Locke, “consent was
unavoidably a matter of and for the
conscience” (p.145).

In both perspectives, however,
human agency remained bound to
the corporeal self. The key distinction
was that Locke believed humans
could be trained to act rationally
through education and discipline.
Herein, discipline and proper
conduct play an essential role in
Locke’s framework. While Hobbes’s
state, being comprehensive, left no
room for “unreason,” which was

precisely what it aimed to eliminate;
however, for Locke, “unreason
denotes what lies beyond the space
of collective living and threatens to
tear it apart” (p.166). This difference
in approach had broader
implications.

Locke’s labour theory of value
further developed the individual’s
role in property creation. Through
“appropriation,” he defined the
mechanism by which something is
drawn into the sphere of the self
through one’s labour (p.198). In
doing so, they not only secured
material property but also fashioned
themselves into autonomous subjects
capable of giving consent (p.202).
Epstein extends this logic and
contends that by “once applying his
labour, the man not only owns the
property but he also owns the
‘person’ that he has crafted in
expending himself. A human
becomes a person in labouring”
(p.205).

Herein lies the contradiction.
Although Locke painstakingly
revised theories of labour and
property developed by thinkers like
Francisco Suárez, Hugo Grotius, and
Samuel Pufendorf, he ultimately
compromised the universality of his
theory due to personal interests. He
argued that enslaved people lacked
the right to property because they
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had forfeited it upon being
conquered—suffering punishment
for a crime they committed in
rebelling and failing.

In her final chapter, Epstein
explores how public anatomy lessons
in the 17th century became a tool of
state power. Dead bodies—often
foreigners or outsiders—were used
as public spectacles, dissected not
only to advance empirical knowledge
of the human body but also to
reinforce state authority (pp.234–
252). One enduring mystery,
however, was female biology. Epstein
argues that “modern science’s
subject-object distinction operated
from its inception as a gendered
structure of domination” (p.257), with
nature—and by extension, women—
figured as feminine and subordinate.

Birth of the State offers a
compelling genealogy of the subject-
state relationship. While deftly
engaging political philosophy,
scientific discoveries like blood
circulation and inventions like air
pumps, Epstein masterfully draws
from art history to demonstrate how
the trinity of security, liberty, and
property were constructed and how
they continue to shape the role of the
state. This is not merely an academic
exercise as she seeks to connect these
foundational structures with

contemporary realities, arguing that
the body continues to be central to
state control—through surveillance
technologies, biometrics, and other
mechanisms that perpetuate state
power.

Although it seems that there is no
way out from this system, Epstein
emphasises the enduring potential of
human creativity—the very force
that originally gave birth to the state.
Much like thinkers like Hobbes,
Locke and others started with
critique, she contends that it was the
duty of responsible individuals to
strive for ushering a meaningful
change.

The challenge, however, lies in
retaining and exercising creative
human agency in an age increasingly
dominated by digital systems. Much
of contemporary labour is now
digitised, and individuals often
merely follow algorithms. For
instance, both Hobbes and Locke
forbade speech that could harm
others. Yet, in the digital age, a single
tweet or video can spark unrest far
beyond its point of origin. The
August 2024 riots in Britain, sparked
by fake tweets targeting a vulnerable
minority community, are a sobering
example. More so, when digital
platforms are driven purely by profit,
they undermine the responsibility of
their users.
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Nonetheless, Birth of the State
offers a comprehensive and detailed
exploration of the mechanisms
through which the state operates and
reproduces itself. It should be read
with keen interest by students of

political theory, comparative politics,
international politics and political
sociology, among others, who want to
understand the evolution of discourses
on security, liberty, and property and
the inherent dialectic therein.
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